
$321,550 - 3346 Bliss Ln #8a, Cantonment
MLS® #638183

$321,550
3 Bedroom, 2.50 Bathroom, 1,648 sqft
Residential on 0 Acres

Allison Acres, Cantonment, FL

READY NOW!!!  New Construction. Beautiful 3
bedroom 2 1/2 bath 2 story home in the Allison
Acres Subdivision. Allison Acres conveniently
located a hop, skip and jump to major
shopping all within the Nine Mile Corridor. This
well layed out plan has a large living room
downstairs as well as a 1/ 2 bath which makes
entertaining a breeze. The kitchen has solid
wood white shaker style cabinet accented with
brushed nickel hardware which adds to the
openness and brightness and contains all
stainless steel appliances with the exception of
the refrigerator. The 1648 has vinyl plank
flooring on the first floor and carpet on the
second floor except in the baths.  There is a
patio out the back door which is the perfect
size for entertaining on the weekends. All 3
bedrooms are upstairs with the master
bedroom containing 2 walk in closets. The
master bath has a double vanity, linen closet
and a garden tub/ shower that is perfect for
relaxing after a long days work. Bedrooms 2
and 3 are ample size and contain closets with
plenty of space. Make your appointment
today!! ***Pictures shown are of actual home
in current state of construction***

Built in 2024

Essential Information

MLS® # 638183

Price $321,550



Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.50

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,648

Acres 0.02

Year Built 2024

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Traditional

Status Active

Community Information

Address 3346 Bliss Ln #8a

Subdivision Allison Acres

City Cantonment

County Escambia - Fl

State FL

Zip Code 32533

Amenities

Utilities Cable Available

Parking Spaces 2

Parking 2 Car Garage, Garage Door Opener

Garage Spaces 2

Has Pool Yes

Pool None

Interior

Interior Features Baseboards, Ceiling Fan(s), Recessed Lighting

Appliances Electric Water Heater, Built In Microwave, Dishwasher, Disposal

Heating Heat Pump, Central

Cooling Heat Pump, Central Air, Ceiling Fan(s)

# of Stories 2

Stories Two

Exterior

Lot Description Interior Lot

Windows Double Pane Windows, Shutters

Roof Shingle



Foundation Slab

School Information

Elementary Pine Meadow

Middle BEULAH

High Tate

Additional Information

Zoning Res Single

Listing Details

Listing Office Adams Homes Realty, Inc
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